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5. https://doi.org/10.1089/acm.2013.0311  

6. https://www.sleepfoundation.org/bedroom-environment/best-temperature-for-sleep  



 

 

MARCH 2022 

 

 



 

 

MARCH 2022 

Health Benefits of Napping (webmd.com)  

https://www.webmd.com/a-to-z-guides/ss/slideshow-health-benefits-of-napping


A  PROACTIVE  APPROACH

EMPLOYEE
WELLNESS

BROWARD
County Public Schools

Established 1915

Imagine a gender equal world. International 
Women’s Day is held annually on March 8th to 
celebrate women’s achievements throughout 
history and across nations. It is also known as 
the United Nations (UN) Day for Women’s 
Rights and International Peace. In 1981, 
Congress established National Women’s History 
Week to be commemorated the second week of 
March each year. 

Gender parity in government, workplaces, health 
care, sports and media coverage is achievable 
through collective actions. This year’s theme, 

#BreakTheBias, will inspire people to think about 
equity, question stereotypes and celebrate the 
achievements of women around the world.

Supporters (both men and women) are asked to 
"strike the #BreakTheBias pose" in selfies. Post 
your #IWD2022 message on social media with 
both of your hands placed in a “X” position in 
front of your chest. Take a photo, and publish on 
any social media outlet for a strong call-to-action 
for others to support #EachforEqual and 
#BreakTheBias.

Source: internationalwomensday.com
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March 8th is International Women's Day
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Source:  

Chamomile Tea Sleepytime Bites | Foods to 

Help with Sleep (mcdanielnutrition.com)  
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https://mcdanielnutrition.com/chamomile-tea-sleepytime-bites-foods-that-help-with-sleep/#tasty-recipes-4252-jump-target
https://mcdanielnutrition.com/chamomile-tea-sleepytime-bites-foods-that-help-with-sleep/#tasty-recipes-4252-jump-target


 

 


